TELECOMMUNICATION FEES AND SURCHARGES

No Telecommunication Fees or Surcharges may be charged to Customers for Services offered through
this Contract.

Customers shall have no obligation to pay Telecommunication Fees or Surcharges for Services offered
through this Contract. If Vendor invoices Customers for any Telecommunication Fees or Surcharges (e.g.,
FUSF), Vendor shall credit the same amount of such charges back to the Customers and such Customers
shall have no obligation to pay such Telecommunication Fees or Surcharges.

In accordance with Section 9.04(c) of Exhibit B of the CTSA, certain Government Entity Customers are
exempt from state sales, use and excise taxes, Section 151.309, Texas Tax Code, and Federal Excise
Tax, 26 USC Sections 4253 (i) and (j). State agency Customers are exempt from the assessment and
collection of sales taxes imposed by political subdivisions of the State. See Sections 321.208
(municipalities) and 323.207 (counties), Texas Tax Code. The Government Entity Customers shall issue a
tax exemption certificate upon request to Vendor. Vendor acknowledges that DIR makes no
representation about the exemption status of any Customers that are “assistance organizations.” Vendor

must request and receive any exemption certificates that may apply from each assistance organizations
directly Taxes shall he assessed and hilled at the rates set forth bv anolicable [aw
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GENERAL PRICING

Term Commitment
All services are for a twelve (12) month term.

Portability Policy
DIR may on at least 30 days’ prior written notice to Level 3, terminate Its use of any Service (excluding

Collocation Services) after the Service Commencement Date but prior to the end of the initial Service Term,
without the payment of any applicable termination liability if:

i. DIR contemporaneously places and Level 3 accepts an Order for a new, replacement On-Net Service
of the same Service type with equal or greater capacity with a Service Term of not less than the greater of
(a) the remaining Service Term of the Service being terminated, or (b) one (1) year,

ii. DIR pays all non-recurring charges applicable to the replacement Service;

iii. DIR pays any actual termination liability payable to any third party applicable or related to the Service
being terminated; and

iv. The monthly recurring charges applicable to the replacement Service are not less than the monthly
recurring charges payable for the Service being terminated.”

Incentives:

Level 3 will waive all early termination charges under the following circumstances:

0 Business downturn: In the event that a business downturn beyond Customer’s control significantly
reduces the size or scope of Customer’s operations (e.g., no less than a 50% reduction in force or 50% year-
over-year reduction in revenue unrelated to activity involving mergers, acquisitions, divestitures or business
combinations) and the volume of Contributory Services required by Customer (notwithstanding Customer’s
best efforts to avoid such a shortfall), Level 3 and Customer will cooperate in efforts to develop a mutually
agreeable alternative proposal that will address the concerns of both parties and comply with all applicable
legal and regulatory requirements and restrictions. By way of example and not limitation, such alternative
proposal may include changes in discounts, credits, revenue and/or volume commitments, the multi-year
service period, and other provisions. If the parties reach mutual agreement regarding such an alternative
proposal, the parties will execute a contractual amendment to implement any mutually agreeable alternative
proposal, subject to all applicable legal and regulatory requirements. This Section shall not apply to a
change resulting from a decision by Customer to: (i) reduce its overall use of the Contributory Services; (ii)
alter its communications architecture; or (iii) transfer portions of its communications traffic or projected
growth to carriers other than Level 3. Nothing in this Section shall in any way alter the terms and conditions

o Technology upgrade: If, during the Service Term associated with the Relevant Customer Order,
Customer wishes to replace the Service identified in the Relevant Customer Order (“Relevant Service”) with
a new, replacement On-Net Service of the same Service type and equal or greater capacity (“Replacement
Service”), then Customer may request that Level 3 provide Customer with a quote for such Replacement
Service. Level 3 agrees to waive any early termination liability associated with the Relevant Service

o Customer places (and Level 3 subsequently accepts) a Customer Order for the Replacement Service with
a Service Term of not less than the greater of (i) the remaining Service Term of the Relevant Service, or (i)
one (1) year,

o Customer pays all non-recurring charges applicable to the Replacement Service;

o Customer pays any actual termination liability payable to any third party applicable or related to the
Relevant Service being terminated, and

o The monthly recurring charges applicable to the Replacement Service are not less than the monthly
recurring charges payable for the Relevant Service.

o Level 3 will waive all monthly recurring charges for on-net services in the first month for all new orders, up
to $15,000 per order. This incentive will apply to one-year contracts or greater.

0 Service upgrade (increased bandwidth): Level 3 will not penalize DIR when moving from a lower
bandwidth to a higher bandwidth service.
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0 Access Services have been updated and furrther defined by adding the following tabs: Ded Ethernet to
Cust Prem; Ded Ethernet to CO; NNI Ethernet to Cust Prem; NNI Ethernet to CO; and TDM Point-to-point
and respective mapping information.
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DIR Co

PRICING WITH DIR COST RECOVERY FEE (CRF)
(CUSTOMER PAYS THIS AMOUNT)

Cost Recovery Fee = 12%

Table 1.1. MPLS PRICING

CLIN Access Rate MRC MRC Description NRC
Level3-IPVPN-00001 56Kbps No Bid Port, Logical Interface, QoS No Bid
Level3-IPVPN-00002 DS1 $156.80 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00003 DS3 $1,358.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00004 1.5M $156.80 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00005 3M $285.60 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00006 6M $509.60 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00007 9M $700.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00008 10M $644.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00009 20M $700.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00010 50M $1,400.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00011 100M $2,100.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00012 200M $3,136.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00013 300M $4,536.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00014 400M $5,264.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00015 500M $5,936.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00016 600M $6,384.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00017 1GigE $8,176.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00018 10GigE $66,643.36 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00019 OC3 $3,052.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00020 OC3c $3,052.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00021 0C12 $6,997.76 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00022 OCl2c $6,997.76 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-IPVPN-00023 0C48 No Bid Port, Logical Interface, QoS No Bid
Level3-IPVPN-00024 0C192 No Bid Port, Logical Interface, QoS No Bid

Column price includes price for port, QoS and Logical Interface

MPLS Price does not include access loop cost

Off-Net Access pricing from Table 2.1, 2.2, 2.3, 2.4 or 2.5

On-Net TDM access from Table 3.1 or 3.2; on-net Ethernet access from Table 4.1

Surcharges.

Customers shall have no obligation to pay Telecommunication Fees or Surcharges for Services offered
through this Contract. If Vendor invoices Customers for any Telecommunication Fees or Surcharges
(e.g., FUSF), Vendor shall credit the same amount of such charges back to the Customers on the
same invoice and such Customers shall have no obligation to pay such Telecommunication Fees or

Cost Recovery Fee = 12%

Table 1.2: EVPL PRICING
Access Rate

MRC

MRC Description

Level3-EVPL-00001 56Kbps No Bid| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS No Bid
Level3-EVPL-00002 DS1 $95.40| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00003 DS3 $468.79| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00004 1.5M $95.40| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00005 3M $135.39| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
treeyel3-ERIFE00A6I-NG-CTEMA-007 $216.50| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, ®a8q 4 of 87$0.00
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DIR Co

Level3-EVPL-00007 IM $296.72| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00008 10M $333.65] Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00009 20M $396.41| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00010 50M $409.49] Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00011 100M $544.45] Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00012 200M $996.11| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00013 300M $1,385.15| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00014 400M $1,701.52| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00015 500M $2,001.20| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00016 600M $2,284.22| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00017 1GigE $3,166.12| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00018 10GigE $69,440.00| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00019 OC3 $965.15] Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00020 OC3c $965.15] Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00021 0C12 $2,508.22| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00022 0OC12c $2,508.22| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS $0.00
Level3-EVPL-00023 0C48 No Bid| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS No Bigl
Level3-EVPL-00024 OC192 No Bid| Port, Logical Interface Mileage, QoS No BI

Total price includes price for port, QoS and Logical Interface Mileage

EVPL Price does not include access loop cost or MEA equipment

Off-Net Access pricing from Table 2.1, 2.2, 2.3, 2.4 or 2.5

0 On-Net TDM access available from Section 3.1 Tables 3.1 or 3.2; on-net Ethernet access from Table

5.1

0 MEA pricing from Section 6.2, if necessary

Cost Recovery Fee = 12%

Table 1.3: VPLS PRICING Metro

Access Rate MRC MRC Description
Level3-mVPLS-00001 56Kbps No Bid Port, Logical Interface, QoS No Bid
Level3-mVPLS-00002 DS1 $69.44 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00003 DS3 $450.80 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00004 1.5M $69.44 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00005 3M $124.32 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00006 6M $213.92 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00007 OM $296.80 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00008 10M $310.24 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00009 20M $336.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00010 50M $476.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00011 100M $532.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00012 200M $840.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00013 300M $1,176.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00014 400M $1,321.60 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00015 500M $1,456.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00016 600M $1,545.60 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00017 1GigE $1,904.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00018 10GigE $15,120.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00019 OC3 $946.96 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00020 OC3c $946.96 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00021 0C12 $1,769.60 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00022 OCl2c $1,769.60 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-mVPLS-00023 0C48 No Bid Port, Logical Interface, QoS No Bid
ravel3amVIR-SE004-N G- OERD07 No Bid Port, Logical Interface, QoSPagdg 5 of 89 Bld]
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Column price includes price for port, QoS and Logical Interface

VPLS Price does not include access loop cost or MEA equipment

Off-Net Access pricing from Table 2.1, 2.2, 2.3, 2.4 or 2.5

0 On-Net TDM access available from Section 3.1 Tables 3.1 or 3.2; on-net Ethernet access from Table
5.1

0 MEA pricing from Section 6.2, if necessary

Cost Recovery Fee = 12%

Table 1.4: VPLS PRICING Intercity
CLIN Access Rate MRC MRC Description

Level3-iVPLS-00001 56Kbps No Bid Port, Logical Interface, QoS No Bid
Level3-iVPLS-00002 DS1 $156.80 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00003 DS3 $1,358.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00004 1.5M $156.80 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00005 3M $285.60 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00006 6M $509.60 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00007 OM $700.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00008 10M $728.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00009 20M $784.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00010 50M $1,400.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00011 100M $2,100.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00012 200M $3,080.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iIVPLS-00013 300M $4,536.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iIVPLS-00014 400M $5,264.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00015 500M $5,936.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00016 600M $6,384.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00017 1GigE $8,176.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00018 10GigE $69,440.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00019 OC3 $2,942.80 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00020 OC3c $2,942.80 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00021 0C12 $6,608.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00022 OCl2c $6,608.00 Port, Logical Interface, QoS $0.00
Level3-iVPLS-00023 0C48 No Bid Port, Logical Interface, QoS No Big:l
Level3-iVPLS-00024 0OC192 No Bid Port, Logical Interface, QoS No BI

Column price includes price for port, QoS and Logical Interface

VPLS Price does not include access loop cost or MEA equipment

Off-Net Access pricing from Table 2.1, 2.2, 2.3, 2.4 or 2.5

0 On-Net TDM access available from Section 3.1 Tables 3.1 or 3.2; on-net Ethernet access from Table

5.1

0 MEA pricing from Section 6.2, if necessary
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PRICING WITH DIR COST RECOVERY FEE (CRF)
(CUSTOMER PAYS THIS AMOUNT)

Cost Recovery Fee = 12%

[Taple 2.1. Dedicated EInernet AcCess Pricing to customer
Premise (Point to Point)

CLIN Access Rate MRC MRC Description NRC
Level3-EthP2P-00001 FE $730 3Mb - Pt-Pt $224
Level3-EthP2P-00002 FE $730 6Mb - Pt-Pt $224
Level3-EthP2P-00003 FE $730 10Mb - Pt-Pt $224
Level3-EthP2P-00004 FE $933 20Mb - Pt-Pt $224
Level3-EthP2P-00005 FE $978 30Mb - Pt-Pt] $224
Level3-EthP2P-00006 FE $1,021 40Mb - Pt-Pt $224
Level3-EthP2P-00007 FE/GE $1,044 50Mb - Pt-Pt] $224
Level3-EthP2P-00008 FE/GE $1,148 100Mb - Pt-Pt $224
Level3-EthP2P-00009 GE $2,259 150Mb - Pt-Pt $448
Level3-EthP2P-00010 GE $1,641 150Mb - Pt-Pt $0
Level3-EthP2P-00011 GE $2,259 200Mb - Pt-Pt $448
Level3-EthP2P-00012 GE $1,641 200Mb - Pt-Pt $0
Level3-EthP2P-00013 GE $2,480 300Mb - Pt-Pt $448
Level3-EthP2P-00014 GE $1,795 300Mb - Pt-Pt $0
Level3-EthP2P-00015 GE $2,922 400Mb - Pt-Pt $448
Level3-EthP2P-00016 GE $2,104 400Mb - Pt-Pt $0
Level3-EthP2P-00017 GE $2,436 500Mb - Pt-Pt $0
Level3-EthP2P-00018 GE $2,143 600Mb - Pt-Pt $0
Level3-EthP2P-00019 GE $2,724 600Mb - Pt-Pt $0
Level3-EthP2P-00020 GE $2,143 1000Mb - Pt-Pt $0
Level3-EthP2P-00021 GE $2,724 1000Mb - Pt-Pt $0
Level3-EthP2P-00022 FE $601 3Mb - Pt-Pt $784
Level3-EthP2P-00023 FE $601 6Mb - Pt-Pt $784
Level3-EthP2P-00024 FE $601 10Mb - Pt-P{ $784
Level3-EthP2P-00025 FE $864 20Mb - Pt-Pt $784
Level3-EthP2P-00026 FE $864 30Mb - Pt-Pt $784
Level3-EthP2P-00027 FE $864 40Mb - Pt-Pt] $784
Level3-EthP2P-00028 FE/GE $864 50Mb - Pt-Pt $784
Level3-EthP2P-00029 FE/GE $1,212 100Mb - Pt-Pt $1,568
Level3-EthP2P-00030 GE $1,096 150Mb - Pt-Pt $1,568
Level3-EthP2P-00031 GE $1,357 150Mb - Pt-Pt $1,568
Level3-EthP2P-00032 GE $2,026 200Mb - Pt-Pt $1,568
Level3-EthP2P-00033 GE $2,607 200Mb - Pt-Pt $1,568
Level3-EthP2P-00034 GE $2,026 300Mb - Pt-Pt $1,568
Level3-EthP2P-00035 GE $2,607 300Mb - Pt-Pt $1,568
Level3-EthP2P-00036 GE $2,376 400Mb - Pt-Pt $1,568
Level3-EthP2P-00037 GE $3,190 400Mb - Pt-Pt $1,568
Level3-EthP2P-00038 GE $2,578 500Mb - Pt-Pt $1,568
Level3-EthP2P-00039 GE $2,578 600Mb - Pt-Pt $1,568
Level3-EthP2P-00040 GE $3,132 1000Mb - Pt-Pt $1,568
Level3-EthP2P-00041 FE $1,001 3Mb - Pt-Pt $1,120




Level3-EthP2P-00042 FE $1,001 6Mb - Pt-Pt $1,120
Level3-EthP2P-00043 FE $1,001 10Mb - Pt-Pt $1,120
Level3-EthP2P-00044 FE $1,108 20Mb - Pt-Pt $1,680
Level3-EthP2P-00045 FE $1,214 30Mb - Pt-Pt $1,680
Level3-EthP2P-00046 FE $1,320 40Mb - Pt-Pt $1,680
Level3-EthP2P-00047 FE/GE $1,428 50Mb - Pt-Pt $1,680
Level3-EthP2P-00048 FE/GE $1,961 100Mb - Pt-Pt $1,680
Level3-EthP2P-00049 GE $2,278 150Mb - Pt-Pt $3,360
Level3-EthP2P-00050 GE $2,672 150Mb - Pt-Pt $3,360
Level3-EthP2P-00051 GE $2,349 200Mb - Pt-Pt $3,360
Level3-EthP2P-00052 GE $2,755 200Mb - Pt-Pt $3,360
Level3-EthP2P-00053 GE $2,490 300Mb - Pt-Pt $3,360
Level3-EthP2P-00054 GE $2,921 300Mb - Pt-Pt $3,360
Level3-EthP2P-00055 GE $2,631 400Mb - Pt-Pt $3,360
Level3-EthP2P-00056 GE $3,088 400Mb - Pt-Pt $3,360
Level3-EthP2P-00057 GE $2,772 500Mb - Pt-Pt $3,360
Level3-EthP2P-00058 GE $2,913 600Mb - Pt-Pt $4,480
Level3-EthP2P-00059 GE $3,466 1000Mb - Pt-Pt $4,480
Level3-EthP2P-00060 FE $790 3Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00061 FE $790 6Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00062 FE $790 10Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00063 FE $1,568 10Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00064 FE $853 20Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00065 FE $1,650 20Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00066 FE $1,012 30Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00067 FE $1,951 30Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00068 FE $1,012 40Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00069 FE $1,951 40Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00070 FE/GE $1,012 50Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00071 FE/GE $1,951 50Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00072 FE/GE $1,388 100Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00073 FE/GE $2,287 100Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00074 GE $1,607 150Mb - Pt-Pt $560
Level3-EthP2P-00075 GE $2,219 150Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00076 GE $3,294 150Mb - Pt-Pt $560
Level3-EthP2P-00077 GE $4,108 150Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00078 GE $1,607 200Mb - Pt-Pt $560
Level3-EthP2P-00079 GE $2,219 200Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00080 GE $3,294 200Mb - Pt-Pt $560
Level3-EthP2P-00081 GE $4,108 200Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00082 GE $2,363 300Mb - Pt-Pt $560
Level3-EthP2P-00083 GE $2,829 300Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00084 GE $4,108 300Mb - Pt-Pt $560
Level3-EthP2P-00085 GE $5,271 300Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00086 GE $2,363 400Mb - Pt-Pt $560
Level3-EthP2P-00087 GE $2,829 400Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00088 GE $4,108 400Mb - Pt-Pt $560
Level3-EthP2P-00089 GE $5,271 400Mb - Pt-Pt $840
Level3-EthP2P-00090 GE $2,363 500Mb - Pt-Pt $560




Level3-EthP2P-00091 GE $4,108 500Mb - Pt-Pt $560
Level3-EthP2P-00092 GE $2,654 600Mb - Pt-Pt $560
Level3-EthP2P-00093 GE $7,248 600Mb - Pt-Pt $560
Level3-EthP2P-00094 GE $2,654 1000Mb - Pt-Pt $560
Level3-EthP2P-00095 GE $7,248 1000Mb - Pt-P{ $560

Customers shall have no obligation to pay Telecommunication Fees or Surcharges

for Services offered through this Contract. If Vendor invoices Customers for any

Telecommunication Fees or Surcharges (e.g., FUSF), Vendor shall credit the same

amount of such charges back to the Customers on the same invoice and such
Customers shall have no obligation to pay such Telecommunication Fees or

Surcharges.




Table 2.1.1: CLIN Mapping to Customer Premise; Use with Table 2.2

Building CLLI Address Interface Access Speed Access Type
Level3-EthP2P-00024 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON FE 10_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00029 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON FE 100_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00064 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON FE 20_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00022 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON FE 3_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00026 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON FE 30_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00027 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON FE 40_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00028 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON FE 50_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00023 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON FE 6_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00029 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON GE 100_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00094 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON GE 1000_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00031 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON GE 150_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00079 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON GE 200_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00035 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON GE 300_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00087 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON GE 400_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00028 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON GE 50_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00090 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON GE 500_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00039 ADSNTXAE 5080 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON GE 600_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00070 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 50_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00090 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 500_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00092 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 600_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00062 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON FE 10_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00072 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON FE 100_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00064 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON FE 20_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00060 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON FE 3_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00066 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON FE 30_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00068 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON FE 40_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00070 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON FE 50_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00061 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON FE 6_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00072 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 100_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00094 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 1000_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00075 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 150_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00079 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 200_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00083 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 300_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00087 ADSNTXAZ 3939 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 400_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00062 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON FE 10_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00072 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON FE 100_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00064 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON FE 20_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00060 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON FE 3_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00066 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON FE 30_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00068 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON FE 40_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00070 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON FE 50_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00061 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON FE 6_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00072 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 100_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00094 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 1000_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00075 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 150_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00079 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 200_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00083 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 300_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00087 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 400_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00070 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 50_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00090 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 500_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00092 ADSNTXCD 4560 BELT LINE RD-ADDISON GE 600_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00043 ADSNTXCE 5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON FE 10_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00048 ADSNTXCE 5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON FE 100_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00044 ADSNTXCE 5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON FE 20_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00041 ADSNTXCE 5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON FE 3_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00045 ADSNTXCE 5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON FE 30_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00046 ADSNTXCE 5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON FE 40_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00047 ADSNTXCE 5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON FE 50_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00042 ADSNTXCE 5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON FE 6_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00048 ADSNTXCE 5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON GE 100_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00059 ADSNTXCE 5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON GE 1000_MBPS Dedicated
Level3-EthP2P-00050 ADSNTXCE 5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON GE 150_MBPS Dedicated

Level3-EthP2P-00052 ADSNTXCE 5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON GE 200_MBPS Dedicated



Level3-EthP2P-00054
Level3-EthP2P-00056
Level3-EthP2P-00047
Level3-EthP2P-00057
Level3-EthP2P-00058
Level3-EthP2P-00062
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00064
Level3-EthP2P-00060
Level3-EthP2P-00066
Level3-EthP2P-00068
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00061
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00094
Level3-EthP2P-00075
Level3-EthP2P-00079
Level3-EthP2P-00083
Level3-EthP2P-00087
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00090
Level3-EthP2P-00092
Level3-EthP2P-00043
Level3-EthP2P-00048
Level3-EthP2P-00044
Level3-EthP2P-00041
Level3-EthP2P-00045
Level3-EthP2P-00046
Level3-EthP2P-00047
Level3-EthP2P-00047
Level3-EthP2P-00057
Level3-EthP2P-00058
Level3-EthP2P-00042
Level3-EthP2P-00048
Level3-EthP2P-00059
Level3-EthP2P-00050
Level3-EthP2P-00052
Level3-EthP2P-00054
Level3-EthP2P-00056
Level3-EthP2P-00043
Level3-EthP2P-00048
Level3-EthP2P-00044
Level3-EthP2P-00041
Level3-EthP2P-00045
Level3-EthP2P-00046
Level3-EthP2P-00047
Level3-EthP2P-00042
Level3-EthP2P-00048
Level3-EthP2P-00059
Level3-EthP2P-00050
Level3-EthP2P-00052
Level3-EthP2P-00054
Level3-EthP2P-00056
Level3-EthP2P-00047
Level3-EthP2P-00057
Level3-EthP2P-00058
Level3-EthP2P-00062
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00064
Level3-EthP2P-00060
Level3-EthP2P-00066
Level3-EthP2P-00068
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00061
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00094

ADSNTXCE
ADSNTXCE
ADSNTXCE
ADSNTXCE
ADSNTXCE
ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCJ

ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXCR
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXFY
ADSNTXHU
ADSNTXHU
ADSNTXHU
ADSNTXHU
ADSNTXHU
ADSNTXHU
ADSNTXHU
ADSNTXHU
ADSNTXHU
ADSNTXHU

5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5055 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

14315 MIDWAY RD-ADDISON

5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
5057 KELLER SPRINGS RD-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15305 DALLAS PKWY-ADDISON
15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON
15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON
15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON
15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON
15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON
15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON
15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON
15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON
15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON
15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON

GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
GE
GE
GE
FE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
GE
GE

300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
10_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
3_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
6_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
10_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
3_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
6_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
10_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
3_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
6_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
10_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
3_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
6_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS

Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated



Level3-EthP2P-00075
Level3-EthP2P-00079
Level3-EthP2P-00083
Level3-EthP2P-00087
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00090
Level3-EthP2P-00092
Level3-EthP2P-00020
Level3-EthP2P-00009
Level3-EthP2P-00011
Level3-EthP2P-00013
Level3-EthP2P-00015
Level3-EthP2P-00017
Level3-EthP2P-00018
Level3-EthP2P-00063
Level3-EthP2P-00081
Level3-EthP2P-00085
Level3-EthP2P-00089
Level3-EthP2P-00071
Level3-EthP2P-00091
Level3-EthP2P-00093
Level3-EthP2P-00073
Level3-EthP2P-00065
Level3-EthP2P-00067
Level3-EthP2P-00069
Level3-EthP2P-00071
Level3-EthP2P-00073
Level3-EthP2P-00095
Level3-EthP2P-00077
Level3-EthP2P-00063
Level3-EthP2P-00093
Level3-EthP2P-00073
Level3-EthP2P-00065
Level3-EthP2P-00067
Level3-EthP2P-00069
Level3-EthP2P-00071
Level3-EthP2P-00073
Level3-EthP2P-00095
Level3-EthP2P-00077
Level3-EthP2P-00081
Level3-EthP2P-00085
Level3-EthP2P-00089
Level3-EthP2P-00071
Level3-EthP2P-00091
Level3-EthP2P-00063
Level3-EthP2P-00073
Level3-EthP2P-00065
Level3-EthP2P-00067
Level3-EthP2P-00069
Level3-EthP2P-00071
Level3-EthP2P-00073
Level3-EthP2P-00095
Level3-EthP2P-00077
Level3-EthP2P-00081
Level3-EthP2P-00085
Level3-EthP2P-00089
Level3-EthP2P-00071
Level3-EthP2P-00091
Level3-EthP2P-00093
Level3-EthP2P-00091
Level3-EthP2P-00093
Level3-EthP2P-00063
Level3-EthP2P-00073
Level3-EthP2P-00065
Level3-EthP2P-00067
Level3-EthP2P-00069

ADSNTXHU
ADSNTXHU
ADSNTXHU
ADSNTXHU
ADSNTXHU
ADSNTXHU
ADSNTXHU
ADSNTXHV
ADSNTXHV
ADSNTXHV
ADSNTXHV
ADSNTXHV
ADSNTXHV
ADSNTXHV
ALAMTXAP
ALAMTXAP
ALAMTXAP
ALAMTXAP
ALAMTXAP
ALAMTXAP
ALAMTXAP
ALAMTXAP
ALAMTXAP
ALAMTXAP
ALAMTXAP
ALAMTXAP
ALAMTXAP
ALAMTXAP
ALAMTXAP
ALAMTXBY
ALAMTXBY
ALAMTXBY
ALAMTXBY
ALAMTXBY
ALAMTXBY
ALAMTXBY
ALAMTXBY
ALAMTXBY
ALAMTXBY
ALAMTXBY
ALAMTXBY
ALAMTXBY
ALAMTXBY
ALAMTXBY
ALICTXFT
ALICTXFT
ALICTXFT
ALICTXFT
ALICTXFT
ALICTXFT
ALICTXFT
ALICTXFT
ALICTXFT
ALICTXFT
ALICTXFT
ALICTXFT
ALICTXFT
ALICTXFT
ALICTXFT
ALICTXHG
ALICTXHG
ALICTXHG
ALICTXHG
ALICTXHG
ALICTXHG
ALICTXHG

15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON
15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON
15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON
15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON
15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON
15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON
15301 SPECTRUM DR-ADDISON
4550 EXCEL PKY-ADDISON
4550 EXCEL PKY-ADDISON
4550 EXCEL PKY-ADDISON
4550 EXCEL PKY-ADDISON
4550 EXCEL PKY-ADDISON
4550 EXCEL PKY-ADDISON
4550 EXCEL PKY-ADDISON

423 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

423 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

423 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

423 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

423 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

423 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

423 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

423 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

423 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

423 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

423 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

423 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

423 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

423 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

423 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

416 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

416 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

416 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

416 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

416 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

416 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

416 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

416 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

416 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

416 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

416 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

416 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

416 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

416 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

416 N TOWER RD-ALAMO

1818 E MAIN ST-ALICE

1818 E MAIN ST-ALICE

1818 E MAIN ST-ALICE

1818 E MAIN ST-ALICE

1818 E MAIN ST-ALICE

1818 E MAIN ST-ALICE

1818 E MAIN ST-ALICE

1818 E MAIN ST-ALICE

1818 E MAIN ST-ALICE

1818 E MAIN ST-ALICE

1818 E MAIN ST-ALICE

1818 E MAIN ST-ALICE

1818 E MAIN ST-ALICE

1818 E MAIN ST-ALICE

1818 E MAIN ST-ALICE

300 W MAIN ST-ALICE

300 W MAIN ST-ALICE

300 W MAIN ST-ALICE

300 W MAIN ST-ALICE

300 W MAIN ST-ALICE

300 W MAIN ST-ALICE

300 W MAIN ST-ALICE

GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
GE
GE
GE
FE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
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GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
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GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
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FE
FE
FE
FE

150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
10_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
10_MBPS
600_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
10_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
10_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS

Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated



Level3-EthP2P-00071
Level3-EthP2P-00073
Level3-EthP2P-00095
Level3-EthP2P-00077
Level3-EthP2P-00081
Level3-EthP2P-00085
Level3-EthP2P-00089
Level3-EthP2P-00071
Level3-EthP2P-00090
Level3-EthP2P-00092
Level3-EthP2P-00062
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00064
Level3-EthP2P-00060
Level3-EthP2P-00066
Level3-EthP2P-00068
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00061
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00094
Level3-EthP2P-00075
Level3-EthP2P-00079
Level3-EthP2P-00083
Level3-EthP2P-00087
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00062
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00064
Level3-EthP2P-00060
Level3-EthP2P-00066
Level3-EthP2P-00068
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00061
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00094
Level3-EthP2P-00075
Level3-EthP2P-00079
Level3-EthP2P-00083
Level3-EthP2P-00087
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00090
Level3-EthP2P-00092
Level3-EthP2P-00062
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00064
Level3-EthP2P-00060
Level3-EthP2P-00066
Level3-EthP2P-00068
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00061
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00094
Level3-EthP2P-00075
Level3-EthP2P-00079
Level3-EthP2P-00083
Level3-EthP2P-00087
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00090
Level3-EthP2P-00092
Level3-EthP2P-00063
Level3-EthP2P-00073
Level3-EthP2P-00065
Level3-EthP2P-00067
Level3-EthP2P-00069
Level3-EthP2P-00071
Level3-EthP2P-00073

ALICTXHG

ALICTXHG

ALICTXHG

ALICTXHG

ALICTXHG

ALICTXHG

ALICTXHG

ALICTXHG

ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXGB
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXHZ
ALLNTXQH
ALLNTXQH
ALLNTXQH
ALLNTXQH
ALLNTXQH
ALLNTXQH
ALLNTXQH
ALLNTXQH
ALLNTXQH
ALLNTXQH
ALLNTXQH
ALLNTXQH
ALLNTXQH
ALLNTXQH
ALLNTXQH
ALLNTXQH
ALLNTXQH
ARPSTXZZ
ARPSTXZZ
ARPSTXZZ
ARPSTXZZ
ARPSTXZZ
ARPSTXZZ
ARPSTXZZ

300 W MAIN ST-ALICE

300 W MAIN ST-ALICE

300 W MAIN ST-ALICE

300 W MAIN ST-ALICE

300 W MAIN ST-ALICE

300 W MAIN ST-ALICE

300 W MAIN ST-ALICE

300 W MAIN ST-ALICE

1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1105 CENTRAL EXPY N-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
1530 E BETHANY DR-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN
305 CENTURY PKWY-ALLEN

FE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE

402 S COMMERCIAL ST-ARANSAS PAS FE
402 S COMMERCIAL ST-ARANSAS PAS FE
402 S COMMERCIAL ST-ARANSAS PAS FE
402 S COMMERCIAL ST-ARANSAS PAS FE
402 S COMMERCIAL ST-ARANSAS PAS FE
402 S COMMERCIAL ST-ARANSAS PAS FE
402 S COMMERCIAL ST-ARANSAS PAS GE

50_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
10_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
3_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
6_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
10_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
3_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
6_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
10_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
3_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
6_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
10_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
100_MBPS

Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated



Level3-EthP2P-00095
Level3-EthP2P-00077
Level3-EthP2P-00081
Level3-EthP2P-00085
Level3-EthP2P-00089
Level3-EthP2P-00071
Level3-EthP2P-00091
Level3-EthP2P-00093
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00090
Level3-EthP2P-00092
Level3-EthP2P-00062
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00064
Level3-EthP2P-00060
Level3-EthP2P-00066
Level3-EthP2P-00068
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00061
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00094
Level3-EthP2P-00075
Level3-EthP2P-00079
Level3-EthP2P-00083
Level3-EthP2P-00087
Level3-EthP2P-00092
Level3-EthP2P-00062
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00064
Level3-EthP2P-00060
Level3-EthP2P-00066
Level3-EthP2P-00068
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00061
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00094
Level3-EthP2P-00075
Level3-EthP2P-00079
Level3-EthP2P-00083
Level3-EthP2P-00087
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00090
Level3-EthP2P-00092
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00064
Level3-EthP2P-00060
Level3-EthP2P-00066
Level3-EthP2P-00068
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00061
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00094
Level3-EthP2P-00075
Level3-EthP2P-00079
Level3-EthP2P-00083
Level3-EthP2P-00087
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00090
Level3-EthP2P-00062
Level3-EthP2P-00024
Level3-EthP2P-00029
Level3-EthP2P-00025
Level3-EthP2P-00022
Level3-EthP2P-00026
Level3-EthP2P-00027
Level3-EthP2P-00028

ARPSTXZZ
ARPSTXZZ
ARPSTXZZ
ARPSTXZZ
ARPSTXZZ
ARPSTXZZ
ARPSTXZZ
ARPSTXZZ
ARTNTX01

ARTNTXO01

ARTNTX01

ARTNTX01

ARTNTX01

ARTNTXO01

ARTNTX01

ARTNTXO01

ARTNTXO01

ARTNTXO01

ARTNTXO01

ARTNTXO01

ARTNTXO01

ARTNTX01

ARTNTXO01

ARTNTX01

ARTNTXO01

ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAC
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAF
ARTNTXAG
ARTNTXAG
ARTNTXAG
ARTNTXAG
ARTNTXAG
ARTNTXAG
ARTNTXAG

402 S COMMERCIAL ST-ARANSAS PAS GE
402 S COMMERCIAL ST-ARANSAS PAS GE
402 S COMMERCIAL ST-ARANSAS PAS GE
402 S COMMERCIAL ST-ARANSAS PAS GE
402 S COMMERCIAL ST-ARANSAS PAS GE
402 S COMMERCIAL ST-ARANSAS PAS GE
402 S COMMERCIAL ST-ARANSAS PAS GE
402 S COMMERCIAL ST-ARANSAS PAS GE

508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
508 PRAIRIE ST-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
715 AVENUE H E-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
2421 MATLOCK RD-ARLINGTON
500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON
500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON
500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON
500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON
500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON
500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON
500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON

GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE

1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
10_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
3_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
6_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
600_MBPS
10_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
3_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
6_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
3_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
6_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
10_MBPS
10_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
3_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS

Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated



Level3-EthP2P-00023
Level3-EthP2P-00029
Level3-EthP2P-00040
Level3-EthP2P-00031
Level3-EthP2P-00033
Level3-EthP2P-00035
Level3-EthP2P-00037
Level3-EthP2P-00028
Level3-EthP2P-00038
Level3-EthP2P-00039
Level3-EthP2P-00024
Level3-EthP2P-00029
Level3-EthP2P-00025
Level3-EthP2P-00022
Level3-EthP2P-00026
Level3-EthP2P-00027
Level3-EthP2P-00028
Level3-EthP2P-00023
Level3-EthP2P-00029
Level3-EthP2P-00040
Level3-EthP2P-00031
Level3-EthP2P-00033
Level3-EthP2P-00035
Level3-EthP2P-00037
Level3-EthP2P-00028
Level3-EthP2P-00038
Level3-EthP2P-00039
Level3-EthP2P-00062
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00064
Level3-EthP2P-00060
Level3-EthP2P-00066
Level3-EthP2P-00068
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00061
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00094
Level3-EthP2P-00075
Level3-EthP2P-00079
Level3-EthP2P-00083
Level3-EthP2P-00087
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00090
Level3-EthP2P-00092
Level3-EthP2P-00024
Level3-EthP2P-00029
Level3-EthP2P-00025
Level3-EthP2P-00022
Level3-EthP2P-00026
Level3-EthP2P-00027
Level3-EthP2P-00028
Level3-EthP2P-00023
Level3-EthP2P-00029
Level3-EthP2P-00040
Level3-EthP2P-00031
Level3-EthP2P-00033
Level3-EthP2P-00035
Level3-EthP2P-00037
Level3-EthP2P-00028
Level3-EthP2P-00038
Level3-EthP2P-00039
Level3-EthP2P-00064
Level3-EthP2P-00060
Level3-EthP2P-00066
Level3-EthP2P-00068
Level3-EthP2P-00070

ARTNTXAG
ARTNTXAG
ARTNTXAG
ARTNTXAG
ARTNTXAG
ARTNTXAG
ARTNTXAG
ARTNTXAG
ARTNTXAG
ARTNTXAG
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXAO
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXCW
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXEE
ARTNTXJF
ARTNTXJF
ARTNTXJF
ARTNTXJF
ARTNTXJF

500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON
500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON
500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON
500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON
500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON
500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON
500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON
500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON
500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON
500 E BORDER ST-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1111 W BARDIN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1301 S BOWEN RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
1250 E COPELAND RD-ARLINGTON
2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON

FE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
GE
FE
FE
FE
FE
FE

6_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
10_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
3_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
6_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
10_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
3_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
6_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
10_MBPS
100_MBPS
20_MBPS
3_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS
6_MBPS
100_MBPS
1000_MBPS
150_MBPS
200_MBPS
300_MBPS
400_MBPS
50_MBPS
500_MBPS
600_MBPS
20_MBPS
3_MBPS
30_MBPS
40_MBPS
50_MBPS

Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated
Dedicated



Level3-EthP2P-00061
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00094
Level3-EthP2P-00075
Level3-EthP2P-00079
Level3-EthP2P-00083
Level3-EthP2P-00087
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00090
Level3-EthP2P-00092
Level3-EthP2P-00062
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00062
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00064
Level3-EthP2P-00060
Level3-EthP2P-00066
Level3-EthP2P-00068
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00061
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00094
Level3-EthP2P-00075
Level3-EthP2P-00079
Level3-EthP2P-00083
Level3-EthP2P-00087
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00090
Level3-EthP2P-00092
Level3-EthP2P-00062
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00064
Level3-EthP2P-00060
Level3-EthP2P-00066
Level3-EthP2P-00068
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00061
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00094
Level3-EthP2P-00075
Level3-EthP2P-00079
Level3-EthP2P-00083
Level3-EthP2P-00087
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00090
Level3-EthP2P-00092
Level3-EthP2P-00094
Level3-EthP2P-00090
Level3-EthP2P-00039
Level3-EthP2P-00024
Level3-EthP2P-00029
Level3-EthP2P-00064
Level3-EthP2P-00022
Level3-EthP2P-00026
Level3-EthP2P-00027
Level3-EthP2P-00028
Level3-EthP2P-00023
Level3-EthP2P-00029
Level3-EthP2P-00094
Level3-EthP2P-00031
Level3-EthP2P-00079
Level3-EthP2P-00035
Level3-EthP2P-00087
Level3-EthP2P-00028
Level3-EthP2P-00090
Level3-EthP2P-00039

ARTNTXJF
ARTNTXJF
ARTNTXJF
ARTNTXJF
ARTNTXJF
ARTNTXJF
ARTNTXJF
ARTNTXJF
ARTNTXJF
ARTNTXJF
ARTNTXJF
ARTNTXJF
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXJZ
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKI
ARTNTXKP
ARTNTXKP
ARTNTXKP
ARTNTXMB
ARTNTXMB
ARTNTXMB
ARTNTXMB
ARTNTXMB
ARTNTXMB
ARTNTXMB
ARTNTXMB
ARTNTXMB
ARTNTXMB
ARTNTXMB
ARTNTXMB
ARTNTXMB
ARTNTXMB
ARTNTXMB
ARTNTXMB
ARTNTXMB

2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON FE
2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON GE
2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON GE
2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON GE
2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON GE
2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON GE
2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON GE
2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON GE
2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON GE
2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON GE
2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON FE
2401 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON FE

1926 SW GREEN OAKS BLVD-ARLINGT FE
1926 SW GREEN OAKS BLVD-ARLINGT FE
1926 SW GREEN OAKS BLVD-ARLINGT FE
1926 SW GREEN OAKS BLVD-ARLINGT FE
1926 SW GREEN OAKS BLVD-ARLINGT FE
1926 SW GREEN OAKS BLVD-ARLINGT FE
1926 SW GREEN OAKS BLVD-ARLINGT FE
1926 SW GREEN OAKS BLVD-ARLINGT FE
1926 SW GREEN OAKS BLVD-ARLINGT GE
1926 SW GREEN OAKS BLVD-ARLINGT GE
1926 SW GREEN OAKS BLVD-ARLINGT GE
1926 SW GREEN OAKS BLVD-ARLINGT GE
1926 SW GREEN OAKS BLVD-ARLINGT GE
1926 SW GREEN OAKS BLVD-ARLINGT GE
1926 SW GREEN OAKS BLVD-ARLINGT GE
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121 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON  FE
121 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON  FE
121 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON FE
121 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON  FE
121 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON FE
121 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON FE
121 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON  FE
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121 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON GE
121 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON  GE
121 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON GE
121 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON  GE
121 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON GE
121 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON GE
121 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON GE
121 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON GE
121 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON GE
1000 BALLPARK WAY-ARLINGTON GE
1000 BALLPARK WAY-ARLINGTON GE
1000 BALLPARK WAY-ARLINGTON GE
2225 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON FE
2225 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON FE
2225 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON FE
2225 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON FE
2225 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON FE
2225 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON FE
2225 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON FE
2225 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON FE
2225 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON GE
2225 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON GE
2225 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON GE
2225 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON GE
2225 E RANDOL MILL RD-ARLINGTON GE
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2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
2361 N COLLINS ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
7701 S COOPER ST-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
2003 E LAMAR BLVD-ARLINGTON
1117 HARRISON AVE-ARLINGTON
1117 HARRISON AVE-ARLINGTON
1117 HARRISON AVE-ARLINGTON
1117 HARRISON AVE-ARLINGTON
1117 HARRISON AVE-ARLINGTON
1117 HARRISON AVE-ARLINGTON
1117 HARRISON AVE-ARLINGTON
1117 HARRISON AVE-ARLINGTON
1117 HARRISON AVE-ARLINGTON
1117 HARRISON AVE-ARLINGTON
1117 HARRISON AVE-ARLINGTON
1117 HARRISON AVE-ARLINGTON
1117 HARRISON AVE-ARLINGTON
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Level3-EthP2P-00064
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Level3-EthP2P-00068
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00061
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00094
Level3-EthP2P-00075
Level3-EthP2P-00079
Level3-EthP2P-00083
Level3-EthP2P-00087
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00090
Level3-EthP2P-00092
Level3-EthP2P-00062
Level3-EthP2P-00072
Level3-EthP2P-00064
Level3-EthP2P-00060
Level3-EthP2P-00066
Level3-EthP2P-00068
Level3-EthP2P-00070
Level3-EthP2P-00092
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Level3-EthP2P-00075
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1117 HARRISON AVE-ARLINGTON
1117 HARRISON AVE-ARLINGTON
903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

903 113TH ST-ARLINGTON

701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
701 S NEDDERMAN DR-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
1721 PLEASANT PL-ARLINGTON
700 W MITCHELL CIR-ARLINGTON
700 W MITCHELL CIR-ARLINGTON
700 W MITCHELL CIR-ARLINGTON
700 W MITCHELL CIR-ARLINGTON
700 W MITCHELL CIR-ARLINGTON
700 W MITCHELL CIR-ARLINGTON
700 W MITCHELL CIR-ARLINGTON
700 W MITCHELL CIR-ARLINGTON
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1 LEGENDS WAY-ARLINGTON

1 LEGENDS WAY-ARLINGTON
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12625 N | H 35-AUSTIN

12625 N | H 35-AUSTIN

12625 N | H 35-AUSTIN

12625 N | H 35-AUSTIN

12625 N | H 35-AUSTIN

12625 N | H 35-AUSTIN

12625 N | H 35-AUSTIN

12625 N | H 35-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

9500 METRIC BLVD-AUSTIN

2222 ROSEWOOD AVE-AUSTIN
2222 ROSEWOOD AVE-AUSTIN
2222 ROSEWOOD AVE-AUSTIN
222